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MEETINGS CALENDAR
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The course “Summer Abdominal Imaging Conferen
sponsored by the University of Pennsylvania Med

Center, will be held on July 3–7, 2000, in Jackson H
Wyoming, Grand Teton National Park. This five-day cou
is designed for the practicing radiologist who has a prim
interest in abdominal imaging. The participating faculty w
provide a state-of-the-art review of selected topics, em
sizing the most recent advances in helical CT, MRI, US,
gastrointestinal imaging. The fee is $750.00 for radiolog
and $495.00 for residents and fellows. Participants
receive 25 hours of Category I credit. The course direct
Bernard Birnbaum, M.D. For further information, plea
contact Janice Ford Benner, University of Pennsylv
Medical Center (Radiology), 3400 Spruce Street, 1 Sil
stein Building, Philadelphia, PA 19104. Phone: (215) 6
6904. Fax: (215) 349-5925.

The course “22nd Annual Diagnostic Imaging Con
ence,” sponsored by the University of Pennsylva

Medical Center, will be held on July 10 –14, 2000, at
Harbor View Hotel, Martha’s Vineyard, MA. This cour
will include a review of relevant disease processes in
ical practice such as recent advances in cross-sec
imaging. Emphasis will be placed on indications, advan
techniques, and interpretation. Small-group sessions w
part of the meeting format. The fee is $750.00 for physic
and $495.00 for residents, fellows, and sonographers.
ticipants will receive 27 hours of Category I credit. T
course director is Beverly G. Coleman, M.D. For furt
information, please contact Janice Ford Benner, Unive
of Pennsylvania Medical Center (Radiology), 3400 Sp
Street, 1 Founders Building, Philadelphia, PA 191
Phone: (215) 662-7825. Fax: (215) 349-5925.

The course “Summer Musculoskeletal MRI Conferen
sponsored by the University of Pennsylvania Med

Center, will be held on July 31–August 4, 2000, at Ba
Springs Resort, Canadian Rockies. Our core faculty from
annual Winter Musculoskeletal meetings will now be offe
159
”
l
,
e
y
l
a-
d

ts
ll
is

ia
r-
-

-
a
e

-
nal
d
e
s

ar-

r
ty
e
.

,”
l
f
ur

Summer musculoskeletal meetings. Focus will be on the
culoskeletal applications of MRI. Coverage will include ba
and advanced MR imaging techniques used in the examin
of the musculoskeletal system. The fee is $750.00 ($40
residents). Participants will receive 25 hours of Catego
credit. The course directors are: Murray K. Dalinka, M
Deborah M. Forrester, M.D.; Harry K. Genant, M.D.; Jere
J. Kaye, M.D.; Morrie E. Kricun, M.D.; Michael J. Pitt, M.D
and Donald Resnick, M.D. For further information, ple
contact Janice Ford Benner, Hospital of the University
Pennsylvania, MRI Center, 3400 Spruce Street, 1 Foun
Building, Philadelphia, PA 19104. Phone: (215) 662-69
Fax: (215) 349-5925.

The XIX International Conference on Magnetic Resona
in Biological Systems will be held on August 20–

2000, at the University of Florence in Florence, Italy. T
Chairperson of the event is Ivano Bertini. For further infor
tion, please contact Professor Lucia Banci, University of
rence, Department of Chemistry, Via Luigi Sacconi, 6, 50
Sesto Fiorentino, Italy. Phone:139 055 4209263. Fax:139

55 4209253. E-mail: icmrbs@cerm.unifi.it. http://ww
erm.unifi.it//icmrbs.html.

The Solid State NMR Symposium of the 42nd Ro
Mountain Conference will take place between July

and August 3, 2000, at the Omni Interlocken Resort in Bro
field, Colorado. Sessions will focus on biological solids,
ented systems, inorganic materials and glasses, novel det
schemes, and high-field NMR methods. Professor C. J. J
son will be the Vaughan Lecturer, and the Laura Marin
Prize for an outstanding student or postdoctoral paper or p
will be awarded. For further information contact Profes
Lucio Frydman, Department of Chemistry (M/C 111), Univ
sity of Illinois at Chicago, 845 W. Taylor Street, Chica
Illinois 60607. E-mail: lucio@samson.chem.uic.edu. You
also visit our web site at http://www.milestoneshows.c
rmcac.
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